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To the Editor: We wish to express our concerns 
regarding the recent Research Letter by Liroa Romero 
et al. (1). The authors’ identification of the lead shield 
as the transmission source is inferred from the exclu-
sion of other routes, procedural sequence, parasit-
emia in the previous patient, and genotypic similar-
ity. The absence of demonstrated contamination of 
the equipment means this finding remains indirect. 
An unaddressed alternative route could include con-
tamination through blood on gloves if gloves are not 
changed between patients (2).

Nevertheless, assuming their hypothesis is correct, 
the authors propose a transmission mechanism sup-
ported by a video (https://youtu.be/2OW9g2tiBjc). 
However, this video appears to depict a deviation  

from current good radiopharmacy practice guide-
lines (3). Specifically, inserting an unsealed syringe—
without a sterile needle or Luer-lock cap—into the 
lead shield poses a serious contamination risk (4). 
Furthermore, the video omits critical earlier and 
later procedural steps that are essential for fully 
identifying potential cross-contamination points. 
To illustrate the complete process in line with good 
radiopharmacy and best injection practices (5), we 
have prepared an explanatory video (https://youtu.
be/5wGFH6GGe8M). The risk for blood contamina-
tion arises after administration, when the needle is 
discarded and the unsealed syringe is withdrawn 
from the shield. Therefore, the contents of the syringe 
with the next dose would only be exposed at the 
same late stage, after the contents have already been 
injected. Cross-contamination before injection would 
be plausible only if an unsealed syringe were inserted 
into an already contaminated shield before the injec-
tion itself, as depicted in the authors’ video.

We contend that strict aseptic technique, rather 
than equipment disinfection alone, is paramount to 
preventing such incidents. Adopting the authors’ 
reasoning would imply that each nuclear medicine 
department would need to stock several lead shields 
equivalent to their maximum daily dose capacity, 
which presents serious logistical challenges in routine 
clinical settings.
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In Response: We appreciate the opportunity to 
respond to the letter from Dr. Perales (1) regarding 
our article on a case of nosocomial transmission of 
Plasmodium falciparum during a thyroid scintigra-
phy (2). The author of the letter proposes as an al-
ternative mechanism the nosocomial transmission 
of the parasite by contact with blood on gloves not 
changed between patients. We respectfully disagree 
because the mechanism he proposes lacks scientific 
basis; no evidence of malaria transmission by such 
contact has been documented. On the contrary, nos-
ocomial transmission of P. falciparum by parenteral 
route is well demonstrated, through blood transfu-
sions, transplants (3), or invasive medical proce-
dures involving exposure to contaminated blood (3), 
as occurred in our case (2).
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